


Orientation 2022-26 Batch

An orientation programme was organised by the Department of Political Science for the
batch 2022-26. The venue of the programme was room no. 2 (kusumpur Building). There was
overwhelming response from the students. More than 30 students from 3rd and 5th semester
and faculty members of the Department graced the occasion.

The event started at 10:30 am with welcome address by Prof. Manoj Sinha, Principal,
Aryabhatta College. Mr Anand Saurabh, TIC of Political Science department, along with the
other faculty member addressed the new batch and discussed the course outline and changes
in course structure. Internal assessment structure was also discussed at length. A discussion
on New Education Policy also took place and student’s queries were addressed.

The faculty members welcomed students to the new academic session and assured them all
sorts of support for their fruitful stay in the department.



Open House Discussion

PARISĀ, The Political Science Society of Aryabhatta College organized its first open house
discussion on the topic-"Does EWS Quota Violate the Basic Structure of the Constitution?"
The event was held on 21st November 2022. Many students participated in the event and
brainstormed on the given theme and added many dimensions on the ongoing discussion on
this topic.

A visit to Dr Ambedkar International Centre

The students of PARISĀ, The Political Science Society, Aryabhatta College visited Dr.
Ambedkar International Centre, New Delhi on 23rd November, 2022 for a panel discussion
on " Indian Union at 75" on the occasion of Constitution Day. The event was chaired by some
of the esteemed professors of Delhi University including Dr Rajendra Dayal and Professor



Balwan Gautam and others . The panellists comprised of Dr. Sangit Sarita Dwivedi, Dr.
Aditya Gupta, Dr. Hari Krishna Mishra, Dr. Satish Jha and Dr. Aditya Narayan Mishra. The
panellists presented their papers on diverse topics such as "Dr Ambedkar's views on Nation",
"Celebrating the Will of people" etc which enriched students’ knowledge on Ambedkar’s
philosophy. Overall the discussion was very fruitful which concluded with an interactive
question-answer session by the students.

Visit to Parliament

The students of PARISĀ, The Political Science Society got an amazing opportunity to visit
Parliament of India on 25th December, 2022 for paying homage to former Prime Minister
Shri Atal Bihari Vajpayee along with Freedom Fighter and educationalist Mahamana Pandit
Madan Mohan Malviya on the occasion of their birth Anniversary.

On the occasion various national leaders such as Hon'ble Prime Minister Narendra Modi,
Hon'ble Speaker of Lok Sabha Om Birla, Hon'ble Minister for External Affairs S. Jaishankar,
Hon'ble Minister

for Housing and Urban Affairs Hardeep Singh Puri, Hon'ble Minister of State for Law and
Justice Kiren Rijiju and many other dignitaries paid homage to the national leaders and
addressed students.

A sense of inspiration and motivation generated among the students and it was an
enlightening experience for all the students where they learnt a lot about the legacy of the
Indian Parliament and its functioning.

Movie Screening



PARISĀ- The Political Science Society conducted a movie screening of "Gandhi" directed by
Richard Attenborough on 16th February, 2023 in seminar room and had an interesting
discussion with faculty members at the end .

International Webinar

The Political Science Department in collaboration with Gandhi Study Circle successfully
organised an international webinar by Prof. Doughlas Allen, renowned philosopher and
eminent Gandhian, on the Topic "Religion As Source of Much War and Gandhi's Insights"
ON 23rd February 2023 at 6:30pm. This event was hosted on Google Meet.
The session was chaired by Dr. Manindra Nath Thakur, Associate Professor, JNU and Dr.
Anuradha Veeravalli was the discussant for the event.

SAFARNAMA[ A trip to Manali]

Parisa: The Political science department successfully organised "*SAFARNAMA*", a three
day trip to Manali from 2nd-4th February, 2023.



CAREER COUNSELLING SESSIONS

1. Parisã- The Political Science Society in collaboration with ONLY IAS BY PHYSICS
WALLAH organised an interactive seminar by *Mr. Shivam Yash.* on 10th April,
2023 at 12:30pm at activity room. Students from other departments also attended the
event and made it a huge success.

2. Parisa- the Political Science Society in collaboration with GS score organised an
interactive seminar by Mr R.P Singh, on 05th April, 2023 at 1:30pm at conference
hall. Students from other departments also attend the event and made it a success.

3. Parisa- the Political Science Society in collaboration with *Unacademy organised an
interactive seminar by Mr Madhukar Kotawe and Mr Atish Mathur, at 12:00pm in the
conference hall.




